
 
Gospel Trick Shot Newsletter March 2022 
 
Dear Gospel Trick Shot Friends: 
 
Gospel Trick Shot continues to expand around the world and you are part of it all!  Please check our calendar items 
to pray for and thanks again for your continued prayers and support!   
 
For donations, please send your tax-deductible check made payable to: GTS, P.O. Box 313, Hawthorne, NJ 07507. 
For a specific outreach put the name in memo section of the check or PayPal text box. 
 
*** PayPal please go to the link directly below at: 
 
https://www.paypal.com/cgi-bin/webscr?cmd=_s-xclick&hosted_button_id=3FDVS4LP82BXN 
 
Thanks, Steve Lillis, President and Founder www.gospeltrickshot.org 
 
 
GTS News March 2022 News by Steve Lillis 
 
Africa – GTS Pool and Water!  
 
Florida – Reaching Out to All!  
 
Las Vegas – Reaching the Billiard World!  
 
Africa – GTS Pool and Water – The work has begun as our first water well that was funded by GTS has been started 
in Lusaka, Zambia with Pastor Davies Banda and the 62 children at the church orphanage. A new roof has just been 
completed for them with help from the Legacy Minded Men (LMM). A pool table is next as we need $1,500 for that 
project as we are giving water for the body and Living Water for the soul through Gospel Trick Shot. Over in 
Zimbabwe we already have a pool table up and running with a GTS RACK Room Bible study already in progress for 
the youth of that area. No Bible, NO pool and the youth love the rules! We also have requests for billiard cafes from 
Malawi, Uganda, Swaziland, Morocco, and Tunisia. Please pray and give if you can! Thanks, and God bless!  
 
Florida – Reaching Out to All! Please look on our calendar at our 12-item schedule for Florida coming up this week as 
the GTS RACK Team will be busy sharing the love of Christ with former inmates, returning vets, troubled youth, 
retired people in community centers, people that recreate in pool halls, and people that frequent resort centers. 
One thing they all have in common is that they all need the Lord and we will be there to share the love of Jesus! 
Please pray for health and strength for the journey! There is a detailed list of tour stops on our GTS calendar! Thanks 
for giving and thanks for praying!  God bless you!  
 
Las Vegas – Reaching the Billiard World! At the end of March, we might witness the largest pool tournament ever in 
the world of pool and billiards. Because COVID has cancelled this event for the past two years players are coming 
from all over North America to play and represent their pool leagues in the BCAPL annual event. Right along side of 
this event will be the 3rd stop on the Predator Pro 10-Ball tour which is expanding worldwide into Europe and 
Morocco. Steve Lillis is already registered to play in the pro event and Pastor Michael Hewitt our GTS Vice President 
is hoping to break away from his pastoral duties for a week to join Steve. Please help to sponsor Pastor Mike for 
$800 in expenses. We also have a GTS Team coming in from Los Angeles to join us in the outreach plus our GTS 
friends and helpers that live in Las Vegas will be there as well. Last month we did an outreach in Los Angeles and 
God really blessed! We also look forward to visiting and partnering with our friends and sponsors in the McDermott 



Booth which is always a mainstay at this Billiard Congress of America Pool League (BCAPL) annual event. We 
certainly need your prayers as this will be a tremendous opportunity to share the love of the Lord Jesus Christ!  
 
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
 
Most recent book (2019) “What’s That in Your Hand? God and Pool – The Gospel Trick Shot Story” and the first book 
(2013) “But You Must! The Steve Lillis Story” are available in paperback and as eBooks at:  
 
https://www.amazon.com (just type in the words “Gospel Trick Shot” or “Steve Lillis” to order) 
  
You can also request an autographed copy by email to: 
 
billiards12@hotmail.com 
 
A suggested donation of at least $15 for each book or $25 for both will be shipped postage free in the USA! 


